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The charismatic baritone Dmitri Hvorostovsky looked a little thin when he appeared at Carnegie 
Hall on Wednesday for a sold-out song recital. That was understandable. As the worldwide 
admirers of this great Russian artist know, Mr. Hvorostovsky, 53, has been undergoing 
treatments for a brain tumor that have caused him to cancel swaths of performances. 
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Once he took his place onstage, though, joined by the pianist Ivari Ilja, his longtime 
accompanist, he seemed overcome by the audience’s welcoming ovation. Beaming, he pounded 
his heart with his fist in gratitude. 

In a generous program of 20 songs, Mr. Hvorostovsky’s sometimes unsteady body language 
suggested that the performance took enormous effort. On the opera stage, singers routinely take 
part in overwrought tragedies, with big emotions conveyed through wrenching arias. Here was a 
distinguished baritone — a silver-haired heartthrob — accompanied only by a piano, living out a 
life-threatening personal drama through a more intimate, but just as revealing, art form. 

He must have felt bolstered by the response of the audience, which applauded every song. At the 
end he looked jubilant, as people rose for another tremendous ovation. Mr. Hvorostovsky 
returned the eager waves of Florence Illi, his wife, and their two young children, Maxim and 
Nina, who were sitting in a parterre box not far from Renée Fleming, a close colleague. Marilyn 
Horne also attended. 
 
During the first song, Glinka’s “To Molly,” his voice seemed somewhat gravelly, especially in its 
lower range. But his communicative power and eloquence came through, and as the evening 
progressed, his voice warmed up. Here again were the Hvorostovsky hallmarks, especially the 
smoky colorings of his sound and his uncanny ability to shape a long phrase on a single breath. 
 
Not long ago, it seemed unlikely that he would be able to keep this commitment at all. Last fall, 
during a break in his treatments, Mr. Hvorostovsky rallied to sing three performances as Count 
di Luna in Verdi’s “Il Trovatore” at the Metropolitan Opera. He sang magnificently, in the 
process demonstrating what it means for a dedicated artist to put everything on the line. During 
an intermission feature for the live HD broadcast of “Trovatore,” he spoke briefly backstage with 
the mezzo-soprano Susan Graham, giving a shout-out to fans for their love and support. “Soon 
I’m going to be recovered,” he said. 
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Opera lovers everywhere strongly hope so. He has brought a rare combination of distinctive 
sound, vocal refinement and a commanding stage presence to the Verdi roles he has made his 
own and, of course, to Russian repertory. In the Met’s next season, announced this week, he is 
scheduled to sing the title role in Tchaikovsky’s “Eugene Onegin” in the spring of 2017. 

Late last year, the news came that Mr. Hvorostovsky would withdraw from several repeat 
performances in “Il Trovatore” at the Met this month. Still, he was determined to sing at 
Carnegie (a program he is also presenting in coming days in Toronto and Chicago). 

The program offered groups of Russian songs by Glinka, Rimsky-Korsakov and Tchaikovsky, 
and ended with five German songs by Richard Strauss. Though he did not speak directly to the 
audience, Mr. Hvorostovsky shared personal messages, so it seemed, through his choice of 
songs, starting with “To Molly.” 

It begins: “Do not demand songs from the singer/When troubles of life/Have sealed his lips/To 
joy and inspiration.” But, the song continues, if you “Enlighten his life with hope,” then “in a 
wild flood will words flow,” and “Louder than thunder the skies will resound.” The music 
unfolds with a graceful lyricism that Mr. Hvorostovsky affectingly conveyed, even at the start, 
when his sound was patchy. By the third Glinka song, the poignant “Say Not That It Grieves the 
Heart,” he seemed considerably freer, singing with warmth and dusky shadings. 

In Rimsky-Korsakov’s “What Is My Name To Thee?,” with words by Pushkin, tenderly sung by 
Mr. Hvorostovsky, the poet asserts that his name “will die, like the sad sound of a wave,” long 
forgotten by thee “amidst more recent and pressing concerns.” That is, until sad times come, 
and a true heart is remembered. 

In Tchaikovsky’s “The Nightingale,” another Pushkin poem, the lament of a bereft young lover, 
Mr. Hvorostovsky brought vulnerable expressivity touched with vehemence to the music, 
especially one poignant passage: “Dig me a grave/In the broad open field/At my head 
plant/Flowers of scarlet.” 

Mr. Ilja, who played with beautiful sound and sensitivity throughout the program, conveyed the 
dreamy wistfulness of the lengthy piano introduction to Strauss’s “Morgen” (“Tomorrow”), 
which Mr. Hvorostovsky sang with pensive sadness. Together they summoned impetuous 
exuberance for Strauss’s restless love song “Cäcilie.” 

At the end, Mr. Hvorostovsky gave Mr. Ilja a bear hug and waved to the cheering audience. As 
an encore, he sang an alluring account of “Passione,” a Neapolitan song, and then signaled, it 
seemed, that that would be it. But he returned alone, to sing an unaccompanied Russian folk 
song, “The Sweet Night.” What it was about I can’t say. But every phrase he sang was riveting, 
and the title fit the occasion. 
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